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A.D. 1 9 2 6 . 

25 of 1926. 

Short title. 

25 OF 1926. 
T O AMEND THE L A W ENABLING COMMISSIONERS OF 

D I S T R I C T S TO COMPOUND CERTAIN O F F E N C E S . 

MALCOLM STEVENSON.] 

B E i t enacted :— 
[May 15, 1926. 

Amendment 
of Law 4 of 
1901, sec. 2. 

1. This Law may be cited as the Compounding of 
Offences (Amendment) Law, 1926, and shall be read as 
one with the Compounding of Offences Law, 1901, (here­
inafter referred to as the Principal Law), and the Prin­
cipal Law and this Law may together be cited as the 
Compounding of Offences Laws, 1901 and 1926. 

2. The Principal Law, section 2 (b), is hereby amended 
by the deletion of the words " section 37 of the Field 
Watchmen Law, 1896" and the substi tution therefor of 
the words "sect ion 83 of the Police Law, 1878." 

This Law was published in the Gyprus Gazette No. 1770 
of the 21st May, 1926. 

26 OF 1926. 
A.D. 1 9 2 6 . 

20 of 1926. 

Short title. 

Officer in 
Charge of 
Police in 
District may 
make Orders 
to prevent 
obstruction 
of streets. 

Penalty for 
wilful breach 
of order 
made under 
the provi­
sions of Law. 

T O PROVIDE FOR THE CONTROL O F TRAFFIC ON 
P U B L I C OCCASIONS. 

MALCOLM STEVENSON.] [May 31, 1926. 

B E it enacted :— 
1. This Law m a y be cited as the Control of Traffic 

Law, 1926. 
2. The Officer in Charge of Police in any district may 

from t ime to t ime make orders for the route to be 
observed by all carts , carriages, bicycles, motor cars, 
motor cycles, and horses and for preventing the obstruc­
t ion of the streets in such district whether such streets 
are s i tuate within or wi thout the limits of a Municipal 
area and in any case when the streets are thronged or 
liable to be obstructed, and may also give directions for 
keeping order and preventing any obstruction of the 
streets in the neighbourhood of theatres and other places 
of public resort. 

3. Any person committ ing a wilful breach of any order 
made under the provisions of this Law shall, on con­
viction thereof, be liable to a penal ty not exceeding two 
pounds. 

This Law was published in the Cyprus Gazette. No. 1775 
of the 4th June, 1926. 


